
 Pricing Tally Sheet

Vendor 96 gal Trash 64 gal Recyc 18 gal Bin Recycle Center
Cubic 
Yards Total 2x 

Weekly Weekly 2x 
Monthly

1 Republic Services week 17.75$         8.00$           no bid 2 Rate/Mo.  $   77.94  $   38.97  $   22.50 
bi-week - 6.75$           no bid 4 Rate/Mo.     155.88       77.94       40.25 

additional 6.90$           6.00$           no bid 6 Rate/Mo.     233.82     116.91       59.50 
no bid 8 Rate/Mo.     311.76     155.88       79.75 

2 Waste Management week 12.98$         8.42$           no bid 2 Rate/Mo.  $  128.00  $   76.00  no bid 
bi-week - * 6.36$           no bid 4 Rate/Mo.     175.00       96.00  no bid 

additional 8.00$           8.00$           no bid 6 Rate/Mo.     240.00     115.00  no bid 
3,000.00$                     8 Rate/Mo.     285.00     149.00  no bid 

3 Waste Pro week 10.26$         5.21$           no bid 2 Rate/Mo.  $   86.60  $   43.30  $   25.98 
bi-week - 4.21$           no bid 4 Rate/Mo.     173.20       86.60       51.96 

additional 8.27$           4.34$           no bid 6 Rate/Mo.     259.80     129.90       77.94 
$100 /hr & $96 /ton 8 Rate/Mo.     346.40     173.20     103.92 

* 95 gal recycle

Accounting Manager City Manager

James Elrod James Wascher

        RFP 22-001  Solid Waste Collection

Dumpster Pricing Collection Frequency


	Tally

